CRT-NUTRITION DEPARTMENT PAPER SUPPLIES AND JANITORIAL ITEMS BID 2021 RESULTS
MANSFIELD PAPER SUBURBAN K&S DISTRIBUTORS US FOODS EBP NOBLE SALES WB MASON DUMOUCHEL PAPER COMPANY
ITEM casesize | PRO-
USAGE BRAND PRICING COMMENTS BRAND PRICING COMMENTS BRAND PRICING BRAND PRICING _|COMMENTS BRAND BRAND PRICING COMMENTS BRAND PRICING WB Mason Product # BRAND PRICING
CONTAINER, FOIL 9" 1 CMPT ROUND |Pan Foil 3 Cpt w/ Board
*PCA 7139TP 3 Compartment 200 CT Pactiv foil pan 3 W/ BOARD LID COMBO ALUMINUM  |Y7139TP Pactiv Senior Citizen
1_|Container w/ Lid (Aluminum) 250/cs 25 Durable $ 51.92 3CCOMBO 7937585-SYSCLS | § 43.20 | compartment oblong with lid PACTIV $ 5116 200/CASE AMERICAN ALUPACK IND. $ 66.70 MONOGRAM $ 4535 [200 EA USF CODE 7360514 Combo 37.78 DURABLE PACKAGING INTERNATIONAL $ 9167 250/cs Pactiv $ 65.55 PCTY139TP HFA 67.39
1000 CT Bowl foam white 10 0Z - BOWL, FM 10 ZWHT 25/40 EA USF | Cup Foam 10 oz 10110
2_|Foam containers 10 oz. (Handicup) | _1m/cs 150 Dart $ 26.64 10820 4204350 - Dart S 3172 Use lid 4097457 DART $ 2851 DART 10820 s 65.25 MONOGRAM S 3874 |CODE 6884050 Dart White Use 10 Series Lid | $ 28.17 DART $ 5367 1m/cs Dart S 47.86 DCC10120 DART 37.28
LID, BWL8-16 ZVTD PLST TNSLT | Lid Cup Foam 10 Series 10JL
3 _|Lids for 10 0z foam cups im/cs 5 Dart s 17.63 201L 4097457 - Dart S 1545 1000 CT Lid vent DART $ 2293 DART 20JL s 35.50 MONOGRAM S 19.72 |10/100 EA USF CODE 9954348 Dart White Vented $ 16.78 DART S 3086 1m/cs Dart S 2621 DCC20JL DART 23.00
Plate Paper 6" Light
1000 CT Plate paper uncoated 6" PLATE, PAPR 6" WHT LW 10/100 Pk |PP6W10 Certo White
4_|Shallow paper plates 6" 1m/cs 2m/cs 500 Plastirun S 9.43 2600 3301697-SYSREL | $ 2218 white AM $ 1229 AJM PACKAGING CORP. $ 16.45 MONOGRAM $ 1885 |USF CODE 383323 Uncoated 30200 s 15.95 AJIM PACKAGING CORP $ 1563 2m/cs Pactiv $ 1469 PCT43010 BLEYER 15.41
Knife Heavy PP White
1000 CT Pactiv Knife plastic white KNIFE, HW BLK PLYST BULK PLST HKPO1 Certo Polypro
5 _|Heavy wt. Plastic knife im/cs 450 Summit S 11.24 KDWB 8208326-SYSIMP__ | § 42.93 heavy full length 7.4" long SAFETY ZONE s 1373 SOUTH SEAS S 17.75 MONOGRAM S 29.90 1000 EA USF CODE 8739955 BS1008PP S 11.88 BOARDWALK S 2223 1m/cs Boardwalk $ 1037 BWKKNIFEMWPP. SAFETY ZONE 15.12
Fork Heavy PP White
1000 CT Pactiv Spoon plastic white SPOON, TEA HW BLK PLYSTBULK  |HFPO1 Certo Polypro
6 _|Heavy wt. Plastic spoon im/cs 600 Summit s 11.24 SDWB 8201638-SYSIMP__| § 38.81 heavy full length 5.8" long SAFETY ZONE $ 1373 SOUTH SEAS s 17.75 MONOGRAM $ 2479 |1000 EA USF CODE 8740011 1032000 11.88 BOARDWALK $ 1617 1m/cs Boardwalk $ 1877 BWKTEAHWPPWH SAFETY ZONE 1512
Teaspoon Heavy PP White
1000 CT Pactiv Fork plastic white FORK, HW BLK PLYST BULK PLST 1000 |HTPO1 Certo Polypro
7_|Heavy wt. Plastic fork im/cs 500 Summit S 11.24 FDOWB 7988235 -SYSIMP__ | § 4339 heavy full length 7.4" long SAFETY ZONE s 1373 SOUTH SEAS s 17.75 MONOGRAM S 29.89 |EAUSF CODE 8739732 1033000 S 11.88 BOARDWALK S 2432 1m/cs Boardwalk $ 2001 SAFETY ZONE 15.12
27/90 CT Pactiv Cup plastic CUP, PLYST 5 Z CLD TNSLT PLST Cup Cold5 0z Conex Y5
Translucent Plastic Cup 5 oz. 2500/cs 75 Dart $ 34.64 7354446 - SYS REL translucent 5 0Z BOARDWALK S 3283 DART s 46.59 MONOGRAM S 32.35 |27/90 EA USF CODE 2947430 Dart $ 3231 BOARDWALK S 4032 2500/cs Dart S 33.60 DCCYs DART 43.92
CUP, PAPR 8 Z SNGL POLY COTED | Cup Hot Paper 8 oz White
1000/cs 5 Dart s 25.93 DART $ 2550 DART S 27.00 S0LO CUP S 35.63 [20/50 EA USF CODE 6013353 HC8 DSC 25.29 #N/A #N/A #N/A Dart S 27.44 DCCBLX8H DART 29.95
Cup Portion 4 oz Liddles
CUP, SFLE PLST 4 Z CLR LIDLS 6 2/450 |87220 Dixie Trans. Cup/Trans.
200 Dixie S 102.16 N/A s - GEORGIA PACIFIC $ 137.50 DIXIE FOODSERVICE $ 10589 |EA USF CODE 9428160 Lid S 134.06 #N/A #N/A #N/A Dart S 3841 decpldn NO BID NO BID
_ 1000 CT 10x14 Placemat paper PLACEMAT, PAPR 10X14 EMBS WHT [Placemat 10 14 White
White Placements 10 x 14 100 $ 21.62 white scalloped edge JAMES $ 1043 LAMINATED INDUSTRIES S 11.19 HOFFMASTER S 1856 [1000 EA USF CODE 3053725 PM100 Jay James $ 8.92 #N/A #N/A #N/A Chef Supply S 16.46 LMILp100 BLEVER 10.49
DETERGENT, POT & PAN MNL P19 |Dish Detergent 38 oz Dawn
30 PG S 4194 | 37169 8/3207 P&G $ 4100 40 0Z. 8/CASE P&G S 4550 | MONOGRAM /CLEAN FORCE | $  25.28 |6/32 0Z USF CODE 7912710 45112 P&G s 38.76 PROCTER & GAMBLE $ 5141 8/40 0z. Dawn $ 7577 PGC91064CT NO BID NO BID
[Soap Hand Antimicrb 800mI
9427 Goto-Gold & Klean-Bag-
13 |ez} 2fes 20 & 6279735 SYSREE S3912 | pinkRIG NAA | — KHFOE P —— a1 [ tr-Box. A2 6646 $32064 s Goje 55640 60491271267 600 & 3050
Tiner 43 48 16-C
100 CT Heritage Bag, Liner 40x46 LINER, 40-45 GAL 40X48 TNSLT RHD434816NC DSC Natural
14_|Heavy density trash bag 43 x 48 200/cs 10 Berry s 22.76 HC434816 1763853-SYSREL | § 24.73 1.5 ML black PITT $ 2239 16 MIC 8/25 POLY PLASTICS S 31.90 MONOGRAM $ 5538 [10/25 EA USF CODE 4330163 Roll 8/25 20.69 GEN $ 2776 200/cs Heritage $ 3153 HERZ8648VNRO1 BERRY 30.75
18"x1000 Foil almn roll standard FOIL, ALUM 18"X1000' HD RL1RL _|Foil Roll 18 500" Stnd FA1014.
15_|Heavy Duty Foil 18" x 1000 75 Durable s 37.66 11803 6938336-SYSCLS | $ 37.02 weight OCALA $ 2200 18" X 500" MAT-PAC INC. s 49.50 ANCHOR PACKAGING $ 5258 |USF CODE 6678874 Ocala 55 Gauge 14.72 BOARDWALK $ 7866 18" x 1000 Soring Grove $ 5194 SGVV01979 WESTERN 46.25
T00 CT Pactiv - Pan foll Deep extra [Steampan Half Deep
heavy 2-9/16 deep - Spec listed Y6132L Pactiv Economy
16 | Disp. Foil % St.table Pan 4" deep 100/cs 25 Durable S 2911 6132-45 7465969-SYSCLS | $ 30.93 isn't 4" deep JIF $ 2616 K&s S 34.50 $ - 61321 S 22.68 BOARDWALK S 37.90 100/cs Crystalware $ 2095 CSWFHSD100HD HFA 3114
20 CT Pactiv - Pan foil full deep 3
3/8 use lid 6938228 - Spec listed is Steampan Full Deep
17_|Disp. Foil full St.table Pan 4" deep |  50/cs 30 Durable S 4063 6050-70 7293283-SYsCls | $ 3394 240CT JIF $ 4135 K&S S 47.50 $ - Y6050H Pactiv s 28.23 BOARDWALK $ 5383 50/cs Crystalware $ 4499 CSWFFSDSOHD HFA 4373
Napkin Lunch 11.5x11.5
12/500 CT Essity, Napkin dispenser NAPKIN, BEV WHT 10X10 1 PLY L12500 Morcon MorSoft Wht
18 |Dispenser Napkins White 13" x12"| 6m/cs 200 Morcon S 33.29 123 4096533-SYSCLS | $ 3507 12x13 1 ply white MORNAP JR $ 3265 MORCON D1213 S 4050 HOFFMASTER S 14.62 |4/1000 EA USF CODE 3314820 1 ply 12/500 25.95 MORCON $ 3986 6m/cs Morsoft $ 5581 MORD1213 MORCON 35.40
Bleach Ultra 6% 1GL
Liquid Bleach must be EPA 6/128 0Z Bleach chlorine liquid BLEACH, DISINF LIQJUG CLR 6/1 GA |11008635045 Kik PureBright
19 |approved (seal) 6/cs 50 Austin S 14.68 B6-5 1934027 -SYSREL | § 14.29 5.25% CLOROX $ 1552 KIK S 14.90 MONOGRAM S 13.94 |USF CODE 6696848 | GERM 4H 6/Case 13.59 BOARDWALK $ 1554 6/cs Pure Bright $ 1977 KIK11008635042 SAVOL 15.85
Recycled polyethylene which
complies with FDA rule 177.1520 Apron Plastic 24 x 42
for food contact. Latex free, APRON, PLST ADLT WHT 24X42 DA2442 Royal Paper White
20_|Plastic aprons 1m/bx 15 Safety Zone S 5227 EM 5330873-SYSCLS | $ 7162 measures 28X46 500 CT SAFETY ZONE $ 4719 PRIME SOURCE s 99.00 ROLAND S 6836 [10/100 EA USF CODE 2985933 10/100 0.5 m! 66.92 BOARDWALK S 875 1m/bx Ambitex S 69.26 ATXP2442 ACKERS 500/cs 93.60
Made from PVC suitable for
storage in blast freezer and heated FILM, 18"X2000' PLSTRLCTTR 1 RL  |Film Vinyl 18" X 2000"
21_|Film 18" Plastic Roll 18 x 2000 25 Western Plastics | $ 12.92 914 7435266-SYSCLS | $ 1658 display CERTO $ 1528 K&s s 17.50 MONOGRAM S 14.35 |USF CODE 4836169 |914MEBP Certo s 12.57 BOARDWALK S 1672 18 x 2000 Chef Supply $ 15.00 1BSFSW1802K WESTERN PLASTICS 16.31
Glove Poly Medium
Single use, clear gloves with GLOVE, CAST POLY MED TXTD GDPEMD Safety Zone
22_|Poly gloves (Large or Medium) im 10 Safety Zone s 7.24 PLYVER-(SIZE) 7346538-SYSCLS | 36.79 | ambidextrous design. Handgards SAFETY ZONE $ 4920 $ - MONOGRAM S 32.53 [10/100 EA USF CODE 9865759 10,000/CS s 49.45 #N/A #N/A #N/A SAFETY ZONE 4.91
Ambidextrous, rolled cuff, made of GLOVE, VINYL XL PF CLR AMBDX
23 |Vinyl Gloves XL 0 bx/cs Im/{ 25 Summit $ 78.65 V4231 0952018 - SYSREL | $ 117.07 | _clear PVC vinyl - Handgards SAFETY ZONE $ 6650 $ - PACKER S 9860 [10/100 EA USF CODE 1817418 Certo Vinyl PF Gloves S 70.65 BOARDWALK $ 107.22 | 10bx/cs im/cs WB Mason $ 1214 NWLVECPFGXL SAFETY ZONE 72.52
Ambidextrous, rolled cuff, made of GLOVE, VINYL LG PF NTRL AMBDX
Vinvl Gloves L 0 bx/cs 1m/{ 25 Summit $ 78.65 V4221 0952004 -SYSREL | $ 117.07 | clear PVC vinyl - Handgards SAFETY ZONE $ 6650 $ - VALU PLUS $ _100.72 |10/100 EA USF CODE 7808009 certo Vinyl PF Gloves $ 70.65 BOARDWALK $ 107.22 | 10bx/csm/cs WB Mason $ 1214 NWLVECPFGL SAFETY ZONE 72.52
Ambidextrous, rolled cuff, made of GLOVE, VINYL MED PF NTRL AMBDX
Vinyl Gloves M 0 bx/cs m/{ 20 Summit $ 78.65 va211 0951998 - SYSREL | $ 117.07 | _clear PVC vinyl - Handgards SAFETY ZONE $ 6650 $ - VALU PLUS S 9261 |10/100 EA USF CODE 7807993 Certo Vinyl PF Gloves $ 70.65 BOARDWALK $ 107.22 | 10bx/cs im/cs WB Mason $ 1214 NWLVECPFGM SAFETY ZONE 72.52
Ambidextrous, rolled cuff, made of GLOVE, VINYL SM PF NTRL AMBDX
Vinvl Gloves S 0 bx/cs im/{___ 10 Summit $ 78.65 GVPISMIC 0951980-SYSREL | $ 117.07 | clear PVC vinyl - Handgards SAFETY ZONE $ 6952 $ - VALU PLUS S 9261 [10/100 EA USF CODE 7807985 Certo Vinyl PF Gloves s 70.65 BOARDWALK $ 107.22 | 10bx/csm/cs WB Mason $ 1214 NWLVECPFGS SAFETY ZONE 72.52
Bag Sandwich 7" Flip Top
2000 CT - Handgards - Bag plastic BAG, SNDWH 6X.75X6.5 PAPR WHT  |HDO7 Elkay 6.75 x 6.75 HiD
24_|HI-D Sandwich bag 6.75 x7 3m/cs 10 Elkay $ 24.26 HB-7 7863890-SYSCLS | § 30.06 sandwich fliplock .7ML ELKAY $ 1058 2000/CASE $ - MONOGRAM S 31.68 [2000 EA USF CODE 778654 Poly S 8.16 #N/A #N/A #N/A Ziploc $ 56.74 SIN664542CT ROYAL 2M/cs 13.35
Remote stocked item - Varying CAP, BUFNT 21" N-WVN WHT SNTRY |Cap Bouffant 21" White
25 _|Boufant White Caps case 10 Safety Zone s 51.89 | DBWH21-1 1M/CS s - styles BOARDWALK $ 4296 ROFSON S 87.00 ROYAL PAPER S 86.47 [10/100 EA USF CODE 4201653 Wellcare S 4491 #N/A #N/A #N/A Saftey Zone $ 65.07 SADBWH211 SAFETY ZONE 10/100 57.83
107144 CT Each hairnet is
individually wrapped, latex free
nylon netting construction - HAIRNET, NYLON 28" DARK BRN LW |Hairnets Dark Brown
26 |Dark Brown hairnets lgr 30 Safety Zone S 8.66 DPLW22BR 2099341 - SYS CLS S _16.21 Handgards SAFETY ZONE $ 1105 ROFSON S 15.50 ROYAL PAPER $ 20.38 |144 EA USF CODE 1399005 RPH144LTDB Roval 20/144]$ 9.22 #N/A #N/A #N/A Roval $ 2261 RPPRPH144LTDBPK BU-HAIR 14.37
GRIDDLE PAD, 4X5.25 NYLON 3/20  |Pad Scour G/P Green
20/bx 50 ACS $ 12.94 96D_60/CS 3m $ 1310 AMERICO $ 5.65 3M SCOTCH BRITE $ 33.47 |EA USF CODE 5233994 96NCC 3M Niagara 6 x 9 S 11.57 3m $ 4550 20/bx $ - 3m 12.25
Tablecover 54 108 White
210130 Hoffmaster 2 Ply Poly
28 |Tablecloth 60 x120 25/cs S S 35.99 17507 5875323 - SYSCO $ 52.07 | 25/54X108 2 Ply - Hoffmaster N/A S - $ - $ Backed 31.37 TABLEMATE $ 913 25/cs s - HOFFMASTER 37.65
6720 OZ Powerful grease cutting
formula for fast and effective
cleaning. Product foams to prolong Cleaner Oven & Grill
contact time and prevent dripping | CLEANER, OVN & GRIL K44 AERSL  |CBD991206 Diversey Break Up|
29| Mr Muscle Oven Cleaner aerosol 6/cs 10 Zenex $ 31.89 | 499185 12/200Z 7715362 - KEYSTON | $ 33.99 Ecolab DIVERSEY $ 3427 CHASE 4110 12 PER CASE $ 35.00 | MONOGRAM /CLEAN FORCE | $  33.71 |6/20 OZ USF CODE 7912660 19 0z Aerosol 27.91 BOARDWALK $ 36.89 6/cs s - DRACKET 27.81
6/32 OZ alternate product that CLEANER, AP LIQ SPRAY BTL 8/32 OZ |Cleaner Creme Bath Brite
Comet Liquid P&G 3/cs 4 PG S 49.29 07017 7637430 - KEYSTON | $ 3653 | would serve the same purpose P&G $ 5142 P&G $ 2217 COMET S 45.69 |USF CODE 1939198 Certo Quarts 29.13 PROCTER & GAMBLE S 6035 3/cs COMET $ 39.85 PGC73163 PROCTOR GAMBLE 53.79
Cleanser Powder Babo 21 0z
24/cs 20 Ajax $ 24.96 04278 P&G $ 3478 AIAX S 26.60 $ - BABO Cellucap With Bleach [ $ 24.59 PROCTER & GAMBLE $ 4639 24/cs $ - PROCTOR GAMBLE 39.12
Tape Masking 48mm 55m
TAPE, MSKNG 1"X180" 1 RL USF 120407 ShurTape CP105 2
32 |Masking Tape 1.5 x 50 24/cs 50 $ - 8690810 PACKER | § 51.92 | 36-1"x60 YDS Masking tape MMM $ 142 | 1"X60'SOLDBYROLL $ - PACKER $ 1.55 |CODE 3473469 60YD _24/cs S 4052 UNIVERSAL $ 7279 24/cs SHURFORD 20/cs 49.20
16/250 CT 95 X 912 - Earth Plus
3 panel multifold towel - Made
from 100% Post Consumer fibers -
Ecologo and Green Seal Certified
EPA compliant. Compostable Towel M Fold Kraft
Multi fold bleach towels size is Verified by Independent MFK202 BBox
33 [13x24 and 72count 4000/cs 200 Soundview $ 14.62 P-200N 5767162 - ERTHPLS $ 1817 Verification GENUIE JOE $ 17.42 NITTANY S 18.25 $ - 16/250 S 13.66 BOARDWALK $ 1652 4000/cs MARCAL $ 1435 MRCP200N TORK 18.01
I would have to bring this item into Platter Foam 7 x 9
stock. | have non laminated foam 9PRWQR Dart White
34_|Foam trays 7"x9" Celebrity 87900 | 500/cs 150 Dart s 18.63 87900 5274832 - SYS REL S 1714 plates in 9" round - listed GENPAK $ 2444 $ - $ Laminated s 35.40 #N/A #N/A #N/A s - NO BID NO BID
I would have to bring this item into Cup Cold Paper 7 0z DMR-
35 |Paper Cups 7 oz. 2400/cs 200 Dart gl 75.91 R7N 2M/Cs $ - stock. | have a 507, 90Z in stock SoLo $ 8878 2500/CASE K&S $ 107.00 $ - |0070 IP Champagne Design | $ 83.45 HN/A HN/A HN/A Dart $ 90.64 DCCR7N-J8000 DART 2000/cs 113.78
1 would have to bring this item into
stock. | stock a 5 compartment Tray Foam White Shallow
36_|Foam trays 45 500/cs 400 Dynapak s 23.67 TH10450 4295360-SYSCLS | § 21.94 8X10 500 CT - listed GENPAK $ 2186 DYNE-A-PAK INC $ 31.10 $ USF CODE 8501429 45 Genpak 9.25x7.25x1/2 | S 20.86 #N/A #N/A #N/A Pactiv $ 36.88 0TF104500000 GENPAK 27.93
Tray Foam White Shallow
I would have to bring this item into 25 Genpak 8.25 5.75 1/2
38 |Foam trays 25 500/cs 225 Dynapak s 14.67 TH102S 7004781 - PACTIV S 29.66 | stock. Pactiv item listed 8x5.75x.6 GENPAK $ 1518 DYNE-A-PAK INC S 21.50 $ - | UsFCODE 3503851 |epG2s S 14.43 GEN-PAK S 1988 500/cs Pactiy S 28.44 0TF102500000 GENPAK 19.16
36 CT Sabert round catering Tray Plastic Round 16
platters. BPA free, PET - Recycable TRAY, PET PLST SRVG 16" BLK 36 EA  [A916BL25 WNA Black
39 _|Catering travs Round 16" black 50/cs 12 $ - 5948922 - SYSCO $ 3867 | #1 Midnight black use lid 7432768 WNA $ 3538 25/CASE s - MONOGRAM S 37.21 |USF CODE 7662968 CheckMate high rim S 27.64 #N/A #N/A HN/A Chef Supply $ 42.49 FNLHR0016 DOUGLAS STEVENS 40.22




36 CT Sabert clear dome lid. BPA
Dome Covers for Catering trays free, PET recycable #1 - Sturdy LID, TRAY 16" HI DOME CLR 36 EA  |Lid Dome 16" Clear
40 _[Round 16" 50/cs 12 - 7432768 - SYSCO $ 3310 polvethylene construction WNA 27.34 25/CASE $ - MONOGRAM S 36.28 |USF CODE 7664139 A16PETDM WNA PET s 22.65 #N/A #N/A #N/A Chef Supply $ 3673 FNL9601L DOUGLAS STEVENS | § 31.90
1000 CT 16x24 Unbleached artisan
pan liner - Perfect for high
temperatur cooking that require LINER, PAN FOOD 16.4X24.4 1000 EA |Liner Pan Quilon 290001
41_|Parchment Paper 18"x26" 1000/cs 12 Durable 34.26 1010 7663113 - ECOCRFT | $ 3525 maximum release QUILON McNAIRN 39.14 163/8X243/8 $ - MONOGRAM S 50.06 |USF CODE 730069 McNairn 16 3/8 x 24 3/8 s 34.13 BAGCRAFT S 4836 1000/cs BLEVER s 36.14
500 CT 5C foam tray - Made from
lightweight but rigid polystyrene. Tray School SCPT Foam
Handles temperatures froom 0- TRAY, FM SRVG 14X18 1 CMPT WHT Pactiv White 8.25
42_|5 Compartment Lunch Foam Trav | 500/cs 50 Ecopax 20.97 ST-8-BK 4295360 - SYS CLS S 2194 180F PACTIV 25.25 PACTIV CORP. S 34.00 MONOGRAM $ 3153 100 EA USF CODE 792838 10.25 17.73 PACTIV $ 3055 500/cs GENPAK s 30.68
FUEL, CHAFING CAN 4 HR WICK 24/1 |Fuel ChafingWick  DH200
43 |[Sterno 12/cs 10 Fancy Heat 33.67 | HF03008 72/CS 7092801 - HOURSCL | $ _35.61 72/2 Hour CT Gel fuel STERNO GROUP. 33.95 72 PER CASE STERNO $ 7.49 VALU PLUS $ 4358 |EAUSF CODE 2165183 Lelo 2 Hour 36.79 STERNO S 4144 12/cs Sterno S 4880 STE10106 COLGATE 24/cs S 39.94
Wiper Sport Towel 14 24
8470 Chicopee Lt duty white
44 600/cs 20 Chix 90.68 8290 CHICOPEE 83.36 $ - S - 6/100 79.42 CHICOPEE $ 138.80 600/cs $ - CHICAPET S 88.22
Made of white high impact
polystyrene and with a smooth Bowl Plastic 120z White
rigid construction. Blast freezer BOWL, FM 12 ZWHT UNLAMINATED |YMIB12 Pactiv Meadoware
45 _|Bowls 12 0z 1000/cs 25 Dart 31.71 12BWWF 8467337 -SYSIMP__| $ 102.28 | and room tepmerature display DART 21.88 1000/cs DART S 23.00 MONOGRAM S 15.01 [8/125 EA USF CODE 8666935 Impact S 32.30 PACTIV S 2894 1000/cs Dart S 28.89 DCC12BWWE DART s 2135
27100 CT Container plastic clear
hinged 3 compartment 9" - Rigid
construciton with smooth front Hinged 1 Cpt Plastic
Three compartment tray-Pact IV~ panel - Made of high impact CONTAINER, FM 8X8 3 CMPT WHT | YCI82120 Pactiv8.5x 7.5 x 3
46_|hinged 200/cs 5 Durable 38.62 Cig-1113 2310116-SYSCLS | $ 45.90 polystyrene DART 25.61 PACTIV CORP. $ 51.00 DART S 1571 |2/100 EA USF CODE 1881770 Sensation S 26.95 PACTIV S 1483 200/cs Dart S 4126 DCCCI0PST3 DART S 46.80
One compartment tray, large- 2/100 CT 8" 1C clear higned CONTAINER, PLST 8X8 1 CMPT 200  |Hinged 3 Cpt 9" Plastic
47_|hinged 7" 200/cs 12 Durable 38.62 CI8-1110 2310102-SYSCLS | § 34.05 contain GENPAK 22,94 PACTIV CORP. $ 40.50 MONOGRAM $ 3001 |EA USF CODE 6634190 VPP731 Inline Clear 9x9.4x3 | $ 49.13 PACTIV $ 1483 200/cs Dart $ 4126 DCCCI0PST1 DART s 4230
7100 CT Remote stock Chlorine
test kit 0-300 PPM these test strip Test Paper TP-101
indicate strength of chlorine TEST STRIP, CHL PAPR 10-200 200 EA |TCD Chlorine Range 0-200,
48 _|Chlorine Test Kits 2 roll/pk 30 Simoniz 12.24 | CM-240 100/CS 6100101 - FMP S 682 solution VIAL 3.44 $ - LA MOTTE s 5.39 | USF CODE 8347635 Vial S 2.99 #N/A #N/A #N/A NO BID NO BID
Twould have to bring the 3C 9"
Three Compartment Plastic Plates plate into stock. | have a 9" 1C PLATE, POLYP 10.25" BLK 3 CMPT  |Plate Plastic93 Cpt  9CPWF
49 _[9" Chinet-First Choice 81239 500/cs 500 Dart 26.80 63900 8462774 -SYSIMP__| $ 66.76 plate plastic white - Listed PACTIV 30.90 400/CASE DART 9CPWF S 4350 | ECOPAXLLC/WESTCORP | $  39.53 |400 EA USF CODE 3608396 |Dart Impact 25.94 BOARDWALK $ 4210 500/cs Dart $ 28.06 DCCOCPWE CHINET s 39.04
6/175 CT Bowl plastic high impact BOWL, FM 5 ZWHT UNLAMINATED  |Bowl Plastic 50z SBWWF
50_|Bowl 5 oz Genpak Chinet 81204 M/cs 300 Dart 24.69 SBWWF 8593370 -SYSIMP__| $ 78.93 507 PACTIV. 42.74 1000/CASE DART SBWWF S 39.30 DART S 12.44 |8/125 EA USF CODE 6043137 Dart S 25.28 PACTIV. S 2898 1M/cs Dart $ 2735 DCCSBWWE DART S 35.40
4/125 CT container plastic clear Hinged Container 6"
Square 6" Clear Hinged Lid hinged - Smartlock closure system CONTAINER, PLST 5X5 1 CMPT 4/125 | C57PST1 Dart Sandwich 6 L x
51_|Container 200/cs 10 Durable 3632 | CI8-1160 500/CS 2310036 - SY5 CLS $ 4345 Superior leak resistance DART 41.12 500/CASE $ - DART $ 3077 |EA USF CODE 5863014 58Wx3H s 36.56 DART $ 5290 200/cs Dart $ 3951 DCCCS7PST1 DART 500/cs s 46.49
150/ 24 OZ Microwaveable black
containers wclear Lid, dishwasher Container Rect 24 oz
Black Microwaveable Container 24 safe - Constructed of recycable FPR024 Genpak Black Smart
52 |oz. 300/cs 10 Genpak 6332 FPRO24 2726917 - VERSTNR | $ 49.91 polypropylene. OCALA 37.16 | 150/CASE COMBO $ - $ - Set S 52.55 PACTIV. S 69.02 300/cs Pactiv S 56.60 PCTNC7238 JSPRING 150/CSW LID CO| $ 76.55
Tid Cont Rect Smart Set
FPRO32 Genpak Fits FPRO24
53 _|Clear Mi Lid 24 oz. 300/cs 10 Genpak 49.66 FPR932 s - Included with above item OCALA 37.16 | 150/CASE COMBO $ - $ - FPRO32 s 4591 PACTIV $ 6004 300/cs s - NEWSPRING s -
4/125 CT container plastic clear
hinged - Smartlock closure system - Bowl Hinged 240z TS24RN
54_|Clear Hinged Bowl 24 0z. 150ct. 5 - 2310036 - SYS CLS S 4345 Superior leak resistance OCALA 27.88 $ - $ Inline Safe-T-Fresh $ 64.38 DART S 8647 150ct. Dart $ 63.63 DCCC24BCD NO BID NO BID
Designed Plates w/colors all
55 _|matching
Clear plastic cup PET 10 0Z - Cup Hot Paper 100z
Excellent clarity and upscale HC10SCA Certo Canvas Design
Classic Cup 10 0z.| 1000 3 - 7473525-SYSIMP__| §  46.80 appearance 20/45 CT BOARDWALK 43.79 $ - $ - Sauat 24616 44.41 BOARDWALK S 4843 1000 NO BID NO BID
77700 CT black plastic plate, heavy [Plate Paper 8 3/4™ Medium
weight, low impact cut ressitent 98782 Certo Canvas Design
Classic Plate 9"| 1000 3 - 8462788 -SYSIMP__ | §  72.95 plate BOARDWALK 73.46 $ - s Coated PPIM 79.95 BOARDWALK $ 8158 1000 Dart $ 37.44 DCC9PRWQR NO BID NO BID
/125 CT Black plastic plate, heavy Plate Paper 6 7/8" Medium
weight, low impact cut resistent 98171 Certo Canvas Design
Classic Plate 7| 500 3 - 8593800-SYSIMP__| S 84.64 plate BOARDWALK 46.96 $ - $ - s 55.55 BOARDWALK $ 5562 500 NO BID NO BID
71000 CT, Each Kit contains [Kit Spork Napkin Straw
polyproplene spork, paper napkin SPORK, MW WHT POLYP WRPD PLST |SPKKIT10 Certo Medium PP
56 _|Sporks Packet 1000/cs 30 Summit 13.95 5670 2915645 - PRAIRIE__| $ 25.29 and astr GENPAK 16.39 PRIME SOURCE $ 20.50 SENATE/DISPOZ O S 49.73 |1000 EA USF CODE 4958914 White 1175670 S 14.95 BOARDWALK $ 1448 1000/cs SAFETY ZONE s 18.60
24/50 CT, Remote stock 75%
Sanitizer wipe, meets Covid 19
requirements for sanitizing, 5.9" x |Alcohol Med Prep Pads
7.8", FDA approved kills 99.99% of TOWELETTE, MOIST LMN SCENT 0907357 Medline 1.25" x 2.5"
57 _|Alcohol Pad individual wrap 12 bx/cs 15 callico 37.25 837900 7133511-PACKER | § 81.98 germs MEDLINE 274 FRESH NAP 1000/CS $ 37.00 MONOGRAM $ 1351 [10/100 EA USF CODE 1404334 2-Ply 258 FIRST AID ONLY s 431 12 bx/cs CALLICO s 34.79
Stirrer Coffee 5.5" Wood
STIRRER, POLYP SIP STRAW 5.5" 421388 Netchoice Square End
58 |Coffee Stirrers 10m/cs 5 callico 12.98 950sQP 7584782 - PACKER $ 1416 | 10/1000CT, Plastic stirrer Brown GENPAK 11.44 CELL-O-CORE s 14.27 MONOGRAM S 16.26 [10/1000 EA USF CODE 8913592 R810 18.38 GEN s 1271 10m/cs Roval $ 2753 RPPR810CT R3 s 13.19
171000 CT, Spoon soup plastic Spoon Soup Med Wrapped
white medium heavyweight, 5.5" SPOON, SOUP HW BLK PLYST BULK | WMSSPO Certo White Polypro
59 _|Heavy Wt Plastic Soup Spoon im/cs 1000 Safety Zone 21.63 HDSS3-W. 7963253-SYSCLS | $ 1875 in length BOARDWALK 12.23 PRIME SOURCE S 17.75 MONOGRAM S 2638 [1000 EA USF CODE 8741134, 1104000 S 9.39 #N/A #N/A #N/A Boardwalk $ 2001 ROYAL S 16.61
1000/7 GAL Liner trash 20x21 .35 LINER, 8-10 GAL 24X23 CLR .35 1000 |Liner 24 24 6Mic Natural
60_|Can Liner 7-10 Gallons (28 Qt) 1000/cs 15 Inteplast 13.24 HCXL2406 4988754 - SYS CLS S 2406 ML CERTO 18.43 POLY PLASTICS s 16.75 MONOGRAM S 57.38 |EA USF CODE 2330249 CERTO 20 Rolls of 50 20/50 | $ 9.82 HERITAGE S 1674 1000/cs HERITAGE $ 13.01 HERZ4824RNRO1 ALUF s 18.25
Beard Cover Polypro
Remote stock 10/100 CT Cover BEARD COVER, POLYP WHT REG DBRD1000 Safety Zone White
61 _|Beard Covers 1000/cs 2 Safety Zone 48.26 290-FH3 3290097 - HANGARD | § 53.42 beard non-woven SAFETY ZONE 4563 WELLCARE $ 50.50 CELLUCAP S 67.15 [1000 EA USF CODE 4324406 1000/cs s 49.14 BOARDWALK $ 3587 1000/cs Saftey Zone $ 60.40 SADBRD1000 NO BID NO BID
1/750 CT 12x7x20 pinch bottom
bag12 ML thicknessmade of high Bag T Shirt 1/6 White 13 mic
density polyethlene printed with BAG, T-SHIRT 11.5X6.5X21 PLST 1000 | Source Direct Thank You
62_|T-SHIRT Bag 12X7.5X22.5 500/cs 50 Inteplast 11.62 THANKL 7065842 - SYSREL | $ 19.30 Thank You SOURCE DIRECT 16.22 1000/CASE 900 PER CASE S 23.00 VALU PLUS S 17.55 |EA USF CODE 5466183 10015 S 13.68 INTEGRATED BAGGING SYSTEMS $ 1740 500/cs Chef Supply $ 23.84 IBSTHW2VAL R3 S 23.27
1/250 CT, Kraft brown shopping
Brown Paper Shopping Bag bag with handles, 13x7x17 250, 65 BAG, C-OUT 12X9X16 PAPRKRAFT | Shopping Bag Kraft NR
63 _|w/twist handle 13X7X17 250/cs 50 Duro 7275 EQBAG 2228645-ERTHPLS | § 56.99 | LB bags, friendly SENIOR 57.72 PRIMEPACK S 63.00 PRIME-PAK S 47.98 |200 EA USF CODE 6909648 Senior 13 7 17 Recycled $ 48.45 PRIME TIME PACKAGING S 6194 250/cs Duro $ 81.93 DUM87128 ROYAL s 54.30
240/16 OZ deli container with lids, Container Deli 160z PP
Container deli/soup 16 0z hold sup to 16 OZ, super string CONTAINER, 16 Z 1 CMPT POLYP | FN2003 Ocala Bulk Use Lid
64 clear plastic 500/cs 15 Fabrikal 32.64 PK165-C 8018838 - DELITNR | $ 34.06 | microwavable and di safe WNA INC 37.21 $ MONOGRAM $ 3102 [10/50 EA USF CODE 3563815 FN2005 16480 s 27.35 FABRI-KAL $ 5254 500/cs $ 3500 CSWDCC16PP240 ROYAL 480/cs S 36.99
240/32 OZ deli container with lids, Container Deli 32 oz PP
Container deli/soup 32 0z holds up to 32 0Z, super strong CONTAINER, 3221 CMPTPOLYP | FN2004 Ocala Bulk Use Lid
65 clear plastic 500/cs 15 Fabrikal 54.81 PK32T-C 8231512 - DELTNR | $ 52.50 | microwavable and safe WNA INC 55.86 $ - MONOGRAM S 45.91 |20/25 EA USF CODE 3073455 FN2005 32480 S 54.24 FABRI-KAL S 7956 500/cs $ 55.00 CSWDCC32PP240 ROYAL 480/cs s 77.45
Lid Container Deli PE
Lid Polypropylene 8-320z clear LID, CONT 8-32 Z FLAT POLYP 10/50 |FN2005 Ocala Bulk
66_|plastic 500/cs 30 Fabrikal 19.67 PPLID $ - Above items come with the lids WNA INC 20.70 $ MONOGRAM S 14.92 |EA USF CODE 9275051 Translucent 0832 S 28.79 FABRI-KAL $ 2936 500/cs ROVYAL 480/cs $ 35.76
FILM, 12"X2000' PLST RLCTTR 1RL | Film Vinyl 12" x 2000"
67 _|Film 12" Plastic Roll 12x2000 36 Western Plastics 862 910 7435191-SYSCLS | $ 13.50 Clear PVC film CERTO 9.98 VINYL K&s S 11.10 MONOGRAM S 1020 |USF CODE 4833935 910MEBP Certo $ 8.86 BOARDWALK $ 1116 12x2000 Chef Supply $ 11.00 1BSFSW1202K WESTERN PLASTICS | $ 10.51
Tape Cello 3/4 72Yd
562CT10918 WEBSTARUANT
68 |Packing Tape Clear 1.88"x60 Yds 6/pk 52 - S - Not available MMM 6.68 5.34 6/PACK S 10.29 0 J9o6/cs 1.95 UNIVERSAL $ 701 6/pk NO BID NO BID
15/200 CT High impact polystyrene CUP, SFLE PLYST 4 Z TNSLT PTN Souffle Plastic 40z P40ON
69 Plastic Souffle Cup 40z| 2500/cs 50 Dart 38.74 P40ON 7064604 -SYSREL | $ 64.85 cup soLo 42,67 DART S 53.20 MONOGRAM S 6256 [15/200 EA USF CODE 6702464 Solo 34.15 #N/A #N/A AN/A Dart S 68.17 dccd00pc DART s 47.88
20/120 CT Clear polyethleyne flat LID, CUP SFLE 3.25-4 Z FLAT 20/120 |Lid Souffle3.2545-02 PLAN
70 Plastic Souffle Lid 40z | 2500/cs 50 Dart 29.19 PLAN 7793736 - SYS IMP $ 3296 lid SoLo 26.17 S - MONOGRAM S 36.55 | EA USF CODE 2939411 Solo/Dart PET 21.63 FABRI-KAL $ 5733 2500/cs Dart $ 39.00 decpldn DART £} 30.00
Tape Masking 2 x 60 YA
209048MP 3M Blue 24/cs
71_|Blue Painters Tape .94"x60 Yds 6/pk 12 - s - Not available 3m 21.30 17.04 PER 6 PACK $ - 0 Painters Tape s 6.16 3M S 2673 6/pk s - NO BID NO BID
Container Deli Hinged
Hinged Salad Container 8 oz Clear 1/240 CT Clear plastic safe t lock D750801 Darnel 8 oz Clear
72_|Plastic 200/cs 12 Genpak 25.99 ADO8 4933853 - INLINE S 5276 container DARNEL 26.94 S - 0 PET Flat Lid 23.18 PACTIV $ 2457 200/cs Eatery Essentials | $ 40.00 EESRPTTES NO BID NO BID
Hinged Sandwich Medium
Hinged Sandwich Container 6" 500 CT Container foam hinged CONTAINER, FM 5.75X5.75 1 CMPT  |YTH10080 Pactiv White Foam
73 |Foam 500/cs 10 Genpak 25.67 225WHITE 7336805 - SYSTRNZ | $  26.64 sandwich square DART 26.11 DART $ 29.00 MONOGRAM S 21.00 |6/84 EA USF CODE 6617534 6x3 $ 16.77 DART $ 2014 500/cs Dart $ 3500 DCCE0HTL DART S 26.12




